COUNTY OF HENRICO
BID TABULATION

Bid #09-8735-10RB
Truck, 2010 Model Year or Later, 33,000 GVW, Cab and Chassis, new, with Installed
Combination Vacuum and Sanitary Sewer Cleaner.

Page 1 of 2 BIDDERS
Bid #09-8735-9RB Truck Atlantic Virginia Public | Virginia Public | Virginia Public | Virginia Truck
BID DATE: January 5, 2010 Enterprises | Machinery Inc. Works Works Works Center
11:00 AM Inc. Equipment Co. | Equipment Co. | Equipment Co.
DEPT: Public Utilities
Item 1. Truck, 2010 Model year Bid Number 1 | Bid Number 2 | Bid Number 3
or later, 33,000 GVW, Cab and
Chassis, new, with Installed
Combination Vacuum and
Sanitary Sewer Cleaner,
Vactor 2103, Vac-Con V230 or
approved equal
Year, Truck 2011 2010 2011 2011 2011 No Bid
Manufacturer, Truck Kenworth IHC Kenworth Freightliner International
Model No., Truck T370 4300SBA T370 M2-106V 4300
Warranty Period, Truck Standard Standard Standard 2 Years 2 Years
Manufacture, Combination
Vacuum and Sanitary Sewer Vactor Vac-con Vactor Vactor Vactor No Bid
Cleaner
Model No. 2013 VPD2130H/50 2103 2103 2103

oSuU

Item 1, Bid Price, $188,227.00 [$186,923.00 [$188,217.00 [$188,130.00 [$190,905.00 No Bid




COUNTY OF HENRICO
BID TABULATION

Bid #09-8735-10RB
Truck, 2010 Model Year or Later, 33,000 GVW, Cab and Chassis, new, with Installed
Combination Vacuum and Sanitary Sewer Cleaner.

Page 2 of 2 BIDDERS
Bid #09-8735-9RB Truck Atlantic Virginia Public | Virginia Public | Virginia Public | Virginia Truck
BID DATE: January 5, 2010 Enterprises | Machinery Inc. Works Works Works Center
11:00 AM Inc. Equipment Co. | Equipment Co. | Equipment Co.
DEPT: Public Utilities
Item 2. Five (5) Year Extended Bid Number 1 | Bid Number 2 | Bid Number 3
Warranty on complete Sewer
Cleaner Body and Positive
Displacement Blower
Item 2, Bid Price $18,100.00 |$7,500.00 $18,100.00 $18,100.00 $18,100.00 No Bid
ltems 1 and 2, Total Bid Price [$206,327.00 [$194,423.00 [$206,317.00 [$206,230.00 [$209,005.00
Delivery, Days 100 -135 120 - 180 160 180 160 - 200 No Bid
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Addendum 1, Acknowledge Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid




